
3604 Old Colorado City Road Big Spring TX 79720  (432) 264-2208 

August 13, 2018 

RE: Invitation to Bid “HCRFB MS Asphalt Material” or “HCRFB MS Aggregate Material” 

Material Supplier, 

Howard County Road & Bridge thanks you for your interest in our HCRFB MS Asphalt or Aggregate Bid.  We will 
be taking bids from now until August 24, 2018, 10:00 A.M.  Your Bid Packet, and specifications are attached. If 
you have any questions please feel free to contact me at (432) 264-2208 or 
 brian.klinksiek@howardcountytx.gov 

Packets must be returned to Howard County Auditor’s office no later than 10:00 A.M. August 24, 2018.  
Mark sealed envelopes with either, “HCRFB MS Asphalt Material” or “HCRFB MS Aggregate Material” as 
applicable. The portion that you are not bidding does not need to be returned. 

Return to Howard County Auditor 
Jackie Olson 
300 S Main, Room 203 
P.O. Box 1949 
Big Spring, Texas 79721 

Sincerely, 

Brian J. Klinksiek P.E., D.R. 



NOTICE TO BIDDERS HCRFB MS Aggregate Material 

1. Bids are to be submitted on this form.  Be sure to include both pages 1 & 2. Each bid shall be
placed in an envelope, sealed and properly identified with the bid title and delivered to the
County Auditor’s Office before 10:00 A.M., Friday August 24, 2018. Late bids will not be
considered under any circumstances. Bids will be opened and award at the Howard County
Commissioner’s Court Meeting Later that morning.

2. The County is exempt from Federal Excise Tax, State Tax and Local Tax. Do not include tax
in bid. If it is determined that tax was included in the bid, it will not be included in the
tabulation or any awards and will be deleted from subsequent invoices.

3. Bids cannot be altered or amended after opening time. Any alterations made before opening
time must be signed by the bidder or his agent. No bid can be withdrawn after the opening
time without approval of the Commissioners’ Court based on reasonable acceptable reason.

4. The County will evaluate the bids and make awards for supplies, materials, services and
equipment on the basis of the lowest and best bid, which meet the specifications.

5. The County reserves the right to accept or reject all or any part of any bid and award the bid
to best serve the interest of the County.

6. By signing and executing this bid, the bidder certifies and represents to the County that
bidder has not offered, conferred or agreed to confer any pecuniary benefit or other thing of
value for the receipt of special treatment, advantage, information, recipient’s decision,
opinion, recommendation, vote or any other exercise of discretion concerning this bid.

7. Bidder further certifies and represents that bidder has not violated any State, Federal, Local
Law regulations or ordinance relating to bribery, improper influence, collusion,
discrimination or other similar crimes and all items or services provided or delivered under
and awarded shall conform hereto.

8. Awarded bid will be paid for out of current county funds.

9. Bid unit price on quantity specified, extend and show total. In case of errors in extension, unit
price shall govern.

10. Unless otherwise noted, bid prices must be firm for acceptance 60 days from opening date of
bid and remain firm until September 30, 2017.

11. Must meet Howard County Standard Specification for Item 302M Aggregates for Surface
Treatments.

12. Bid must show the number of days required to produce material under normal conditions
after receipt of an order.

13. Material will be delivered to Knott, Texas in Howard County.  The quantities in the proposal
are approximate. The quantities of work and materials may be increased or decreased as
considered necessary to complete the work as planned and contemplated.

Please initial _________ NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 1 



NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

BID SUBMITTED BY:________________________________________________________ 

NAME & TITLE:_______________________________________PHONE NO:___________ 

SIGNATURE:_______________________________________________________________ 

BID PRICE : 

Item 302M-6001 AGGR(TY-A,B,C or D GR-5 or GR-5S SAC-B) 

2,400 TONS   ________$/TONS $________________ 

Time needed from order receipt until delivery:  

SIGNATURE:_______________________________________________________________ 

    NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 2 
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Item 302M
Aggregates for Surface Treatments 

1. DESCRIPTION

Furnish aggregate for surface treatments in conformance to the type, grade, and Surface Aggregate
Classification (SAC) shown on the plans.

2. MATERIALS

Furnish uncontaminated materials of uniform quality throughout that meet the requirements of the plans and
specifications. Notify the Engineer of all proposed material sources and of changes to material sources. The
Engineer will designate the sampling location.

2.1. Aggregate. Stockpile aggregates for each source and type separately. Do not add materials to approved
stockpiles without the approval of the Engineer.

Furnish aggregate of the type shown on the plans and listed in Table 1. Use Tex-100-E material definitions.

Table 1 
Aggregate Types 

Type Material 

A Gravel, crushed slag, crushed stone, or limestone rock asphalt (LRA) 

B Crushed gravel, crushed slag, crushed stone, or LRA 

C Gravel, crushed slag, or crushed stone 

D Crushed gravel, crushed slag, or crushed stone 

E Aggregate as shown on the plans 

L Lightweight Aggregate 

PA Precoated gravel, crushed slag, crushed stone, or LRA 

PB Precoated crushed gravel, crushed slag, crushed stone, or LRA 

PC Precoated gravel, crushed slag, or crushed stone 

PD Precoated crushed gravel, crushed slag, crushed stone 

PE Precoated aggregate as shown on the plans 

PL Precoated lightweight aggregate 

Ensure the aggregate gradation meets the requirements in Table 2 for the specified grade, unless otherwise 
approved. 

Furnish aggregate that meets the requirements shown in Table 3, unless otherwise shown on the plans. 
Furnish LRA in accordance with TxDOT DMS-9210, “Limestone Rock Asphalt (LRA),” when used. Provide
aggregates from sources listed in TxDOT’s Bituminous Rated Source Quality Catalog (BRSQC) or provide 
independent third party testing data for material not listed or not meeting the requirements of the BRSQC.

Provide aggregates for final surfaces that meet the SAC shown on the plans. Do not blend to meet the SAC. 
The SAC requirement will apply only to the aggregate used on the travel lanes unless otherwise shown on 
the plans. The BRSQC lists the SAC for sources on the Aggregate Quality Monitoring Program (AQMP). 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/100-E_series/pdfs/soi100.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/DMS/9000_series/pdfs/9210.pdf


302 

2 

Table 2 
Aggregate Gradation Requirements (Cumulative % Retained1) 

Sieve 

Grade 

1 2 3S2 3 4S2 4 5S2 5 

Non-
Lightweight 

Lightweight 

1" - - - - - - - - - 

7/8" 0–2 0 - - - - - - - 

3/4" 20–35 0–2 0 0 0 - - - - 

5/8" 85–100 20–40 0–5 0–5 0–2 0 0 - - 

1/2" - 80–100 55–85 20–40 10–25 0–5 0–5 0 0 

3/8" 95–100 95–100 95–100 80–100 60–80 60–85 20–40 0–5 0–5 

1/4" - - - 95–100 95–100 - - - - 

#4 - - - - - 95–100 95–100 95–100 50–80 

#8 99–100 99–100 99–100 99–100 98–100 98–100 98–100 98–100 98–100 

1. Round test results to the nearest whole number.
2. Single-size gradation. Gradation modification for use by Howard County Road & Bridge

Table 3 
Aggregate Requirements 

Property Test Method Requirement Remarks 

Sampling Tex-221-F - 

SAC AQMP 
As shown on 

the plans 

Deleterious Material, %, Max Tex-217-F, Part I 2.0 Not required for lightweight aggregate. 

Decantation, %, Max Tex-406-A 1.5 

Flakiness Index, Max Tex-224-F 17 Unless otherwise shown on the plans. 

Gradation Tex-200-F, Part I See Table 2 

Los Angeles Abrasion, %, Max Tex-410-A 35 

Magnesium Sulfate Soundness, 
5 Cycle, %, Max  

Tex-411-A 25 

Micro-Deval Abrasion, %, Max Tex-461-A – 
Not used for acceptance purposes. 
Used by the Engineer as an indicator 
for further investigation.  

Coarse Aggregate Angularity, 
2 Crushed Faces, %, Min  

Tex-460-A, Part I 85 
Unless otherwise shown on the plans. 
Only required for crushed gravel 

Additional Requirements for Lightweight Aggregate 

Dry Loose Unit Wt., lb./cu. ft. Tex-404-A 35–60 

Pressure Slaking, %, Max Tex-431-A 6.0 

Freeze-Thaw Loss, %, Max Tex-432-A 10.0 

Water Absorption, 24 hr., %, Max Tex-433-A 12.0 Unless otherwise shown on the plans. 

2.2. Precoating. Precoat aggregate uniformly and adequately with asphalt material to the satisfaction of the 
Engineer when shown on the plans. Specific aggregates may be prohibited from being precoated when 
shown on the plans. Meet Table 2 and Table 3 requirements before precoating. Furnish precoated aggregate 
that spreads uniformly using approved mechanical spreading equipment. 

The Engineer retains the right to select a target value for the desired percent by weight of residual bitumen 
coating on the aggregate. Furnish precoated aggregate that is within ±0.3% of the target value when tested 
in accordance with Tex-236-F. The Engineer may require trial batches to assist in selecting the target value. 

The Engineer retains the right to remove precoat material from aggregate samples in accordance with 
Tex-236-F and test the aggregate to verify compliance with Table 2 and Table 3 requirements. Gradation 
testing may be performed with precoat intact. 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit221.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn499.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit217.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn406.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit224.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit200.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn410.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn411.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn461.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn460.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn404.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn431.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn432.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/400-A_series/pdfs/cnn433.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit236.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit236.pdf
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2.2.1. Asphalt Material. Precoat the aggregates with asphalt material that meets the requirements of Item 300, 
“Asphalts, Oils, and Emulsions.” Use any asphalt material that meets the requirements of Item 300, 
“Asphalts, Oils, and Emulsions,” unless a specific precoat material is specified on the plans. 

2.2.2. Additives. Use the type and rate of additive specified when shown on the plans. Add in accordance with 
Item 301, “Asphalt Antistripping Agents.” Use Tex-530-C for verification during production testing unless 
otherwise directed. 

3. EQUIPMENT

Manufacture precoated aggregate in a mixing plant that produces uniformly coated aggregate.

4. CONSTRUCTION

Deliver aggregate to the locations shown on the plans. Prevent segregation, mixing of the various materials
or sizes, and contamination with foreign materials when aggregates are stockpiled. The Engineer will reject
contaminated stockpiles.

Provide adequate initial cooling of precoated aggregate to prevent asphalt or aggregate damage due to
excessive heat buildup in stockpiles. Limit stockpile height to 3 ft. immediately after production when asphalt
cement is the precoating material. Consolidate stockpiles after adequate cooling, as approved. The Engineer
will reject stockpiles showing evidence of damage due to excessive heat buildup.

5. MEASUREMENT AND PAYMENT

The work performed, materials furnished, equipment, tools, and incidentals will not be measured or paid for
directly but is subsidiary to or included under “Payment” in other pertinent Items.

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph530.pdf


NOTICE TO BIDDERS HCRFB MS Asphalt Material 

1. Bids are to be submitted on this form.  Be sure to include both pages 1 & 2. Each bid shall be
placed in an envelope, sealed and properly identified with the bid title and delivered to the
County Auditor’s Office before 10:00 A.M., Friday August 24, 2018. Late bids will not be
considered under any circumstances. Bids will be opened and award at the Howard County
Commissioner’s Court Meeting Later that morning.

2. The County is exempt from Federal Excise Tax, State Tax and Local Tax. Do not include tax
in bid. If it is determined that tax was included in the bid, it will not be included in the
tabulation or any awards and will be deleted from subsequent invoices.

3. Bids cannot be altered or amended after opening time. Any alterations made before opening
time must be signed by the bidder or his agent. No bid can be withdrawn after the opening
time without approval of the Commissioners’ Court based on reasonable acceptable reason.

4. The County will evaluate the bids and make awards for supplies, materials, services and
equipment on the basis of the lowest and best bid, which meet the specifications.

5. The County reserves the right to accept or reject all or any part of any bid and award the bid
to best serve the interest of the County.

6. By signing and executing this bid, the bidder certifies and represents to the County that
bidder has not offered, conferred or agreed to confer any pecuniary benefit or other thing of
value for the receipt of special treatment, advantage, information, recipient’s decision,
opinion, recommendation, vote or any other exercise of discretion concerning this bid.

7. Bidder further certifies and represents that bidder has not violated any State, Federal, Local
Law regulations or ordinance relating to bribery, improper influence, collusion,
discrimination or other similar crimes and all items or services provided or delivered under
and awarded shall conform hereto.

8. Awarded bid will be paid for out of current county funds.

9. Bid unit price on quantity specified, extend and show total. In case of errors in extension, unit
price shall govern.

10. Unless otherwise noted, bid prices must be firm for acceptance 60 days from opening date of
bid and remain firm until September 30, 2017.

11. Must meet TxDOT 2014 Standard Specification for Item 300 Asphalts, Oils, and Emulsions
RC-250.

12. Bid must show the number of days required to produce material under normal conditions
after receipt of an order.

13. Material will be delivered to Knott, Texas in Howard County.  The quantities in the proposal
are approximate. The quantities of work and materials may be increased or decreased as
considered necessary to complete the work as planned and contemplated.

Please initial _________ NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 1 



NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
 
 
 
BID SUBMITTED BY:________________________________________________________ 
 
NAME & TITLE:_______________________________________PHONE NO:___________ 
 
SIGNATURE:_______________________________________________________________ 
 
BID PRICE : 
 
 
Item 300-6029 ASPH (RC-250) 
 
                                                                 18,000 GAL   ________$/GAL $________________ 
 
Time needed from order receipt until delivery:    
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
SIGNATURE:_______________________________________________________________ 
 

    NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 2 
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Item 300 

Asphalts, Oils, and Emulsions 

1. DESCRIPTION 

Provide asphalt cements, cutback and emulsified asphalts, performance-graded asphalt binders, and other 
miscellaneous asphalt materials as specified on the plans. 

2. MATERIALS 

Provide asphalt materials that meet the stated requirements when tested in accordance with the referenced 
Department, AASHTO, and ASTM test methods. Use asphalt containing recycled materials only if the 
recycled components meet the requirements of Article 6.9, “Recycled Materials.” Provide asphalt materials 
that have been preapproved for use by the Construction Division in accordance with Tex-545-C. 

Acronyms used in this Item are defined in Table 1. 

 

Table 1 
Acronyms 

Acronym Definition 

Test Procedure Designations 

Tex Department 
T or R AASHTO 
D ASTM 

Polymer Modifier Designations 

P polymer-modified 
SBR or L styrene-butadiene rubber (latex) 
SBS styrene-butadiene-styrene block co-polymer 
TR tire rubber (from ambient temperature grinding of truck and 

passenger tires) 

AC asphalt cement 

AE asphalt emulsion 

AE-P asphalt emulsion prime 

A-R asphalt-rubber 

C cationic 

EAP&T emulsified asphalt prime and tack 

H-suffix harder residue (lower penetration) 

HF high float 

MC medium-curing 

MS medium-setting 

PCE prime, cure, and erosion control 

PG performance grade 

RC rapid-curing 

RS rapid-setting 

S-suffix stockpile usage 

SCM special cutback material 

SS slow-setting 

2.1. Asphalt Cement. Provide asphalt cement that is homogeneous, water-free, and nonfoaming when heated to 
347°F, and meets the requirements in Table 2. 

 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph545.pdf
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Table 2 
Asphalt Cement 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Viscosity Grade 

AC-0.6 AC-1.5 AC-3 AC-5 AC-10 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity T 202           
 140°F, poise  40 80 100 200 250 350 400 600 800 1,200 
 275°F, poise  0.4 – 0.7 – 1.1 – 1.4 – 1.9 – 

Penetration, 77°F, 100g, 
5 sec. 

T 49 350 – 250 – 210 – 135 – 85 – 

Flash point, C.O.C., °F T 48 425 – 425 – 425 – 425 – 450 – 

Solubility in 
trichloroethylene, % 

T 44 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 

Spot test Tex-509-C Neg. Neg. Neg. Neg. Neg. 

Tests on residue from 
Thin-Film Oven Test: T 179           

 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 – 180 – 450 – 900 – 1,500 – 3,000 
 Ductility,1 77°F  

T 51 100 – 100 – 100 – 100 – 100 – 
5 cm/min., cm 

1. If AC-0.6 or AC-1.5 ductility at 77°F is less than 100 cm, material is acceptable if ductility at 60°F is more 
than 100 cm. 

2.2. Polymer-Modified Asphalt Cement. Provide polymer-modified asphalt cement that is smooth, 
homogeneous, and meets the requirements of Table 3. Supply samples of the base asphalt cement and 
polymer additives if requested. 

 

Table 3 
Polymer-Modified Asphalt Cement 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Polymer-Modified Viscosity Grade 

AC-5 
w/2% SBR 

AC-10 
w/2% SBR 

AC-15P AC-20XP AC-10-2TR AC-20-5TR 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Polymer  SBR SBR SBS SBS TR TR 

Polymer content, % (solids basis) Tex-533-C 2.0 – 2.0 – 3.0 – – – 2.0 – 5.0 – 

Dynamic shear, G*/sin , 64°C, 
10 rad/s, kPa T 315 – – – – – – 

1.0 

– – – 1.0 – 

Dynamic shear, G*/sin , 58°C, 
10 rad/s, kPa T 315 – – – – – – 

– – 1.0 – – – 

Viscosity              
 140°F, poise T 202 700 – 1,300 – 1,500 – 2,000 – 1,000 – 2,000 – 
 275°F, poise T 202 – 7.0 – 8.0 – 8.0 – – – 8.0 – 10.0 

Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 120 – 80 – 100 150 75 115 95 130 75 115 

Ductility, 5cm/min., 39.2°F, cm T 51 70 – 60 – – – – – – – – – 

Elastic recovery, 50°F, % Tex-539-C – – – – 55 – 55 – 30 – 55 – 

Softening point, °F T 53 – – – – – – 120 – 110 – 120 – 

Polymer separation, 48 hr. Tex-540-C None None None None None None 

Flash point, C.O.C., °F T 48 425 – 425 – 425 – 425 – 425 – 425 – 

Tests on residue from RTFOT 
aging and pressure aging: 

Tex-541-C 
and R 28       

    
  

 Creep stiffness T 313             
  S, -18°C, MPa  – – – – – 300 – 300 – 300 – 300 
  m-value, -18°C  – – – – 0.300 – 0.300 – 0.300 – 0.300 – 

2.3. Cutback Asphalt. Provide cutback asphalt that meets the requirements of Tables 4, 5, and 6 for the 
specified type and grade. Supply samples of the base asphalt cement and polymer additives if requested. 

 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph501.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph533.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph539.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph540.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph541.pdf
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Table 4 
Rapid-Curing Cutback Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 
Type–Grade 

  RC-250 RC-800 RC-3000 

Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Kinematic viscosity, 140°F, cSt T 201 250 400 800 1,600 3,000 6,000 

Water, % D95 – 0.2 – 0.2 – 0.2 

Flash point, T.O.C., °F T 79 80 – 80 – 80 – 

Distillation test: T 78       
 Distillate, percentage by volume of total 

distillate to 680°F        
  to 437°F  40 75 35 70 20 55 
  to 500°F  65 90 55 85 45 75 
  to 600°F  85 – 80 – 70 – 
 Residue from distillation, volume %  70 – 75 – 82 – 

Tests on distillation residue:        
         
 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 600 2400 600 2400 600 2400 
 Ductility, 5 cm/min., 77°F, cm T 51 100 – 100 – 100 – 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 
 Spot test Tex-509-C Neg. Neg. Neg. 

 
 

Table 5 
Medium-Curing Cutback Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

MC-30 MC-250 MC-800 MC-3000 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Kinematic viscosity, 140°F, cSt T 201 30 60 250 500 800 1,600 3,000 6,000 

Water, % D95 – 0.2 – 0.2 – 0.2 – 0.2 

Flash point, T.O.C., °F T 79 95 – 122 – 140 – 149 – 

Distillation test: T 78         

 
Distillate, percentage by volume of total 
distillate to 680°F 

         

  to 437°F  – 35 – 20 – – – – 
  to 500°F  30 75 5 55 – 40 – 15 
  to 600°F  75 95 60 90 45 85 15 75 

 Residue from distillation, volume %  50 – 67 – 75 – 80 – 

Tests on distillation residue:          
           
 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 300 1200 300 1200 300 1200 300 1200 
 Ductility, 5 cm/min., 77°F, cm T 51 100 – 100 – 100 – 100 – 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 
 Spot test Tex-509-C Neg. Neg. Neg. Neg. 

 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph501.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph501.pdf
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Table 6 
Special-Use Cutback Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

 
MC-2400L SCM I SCM II 

Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Kinematic viscosity, 140°F, cSt T 201 2,400 4,800 500 1,000 1,000 2,000 

Water, % D95 – 0.2 – 0.2 – 0.2 

Flash point, T.O.C., °F T 79 150 – 175 – 175 – 

Distillation test: T 78       
 Distillate, percentage by volume of total distillate to 680°F        
  to 437°F  – – – – – – 
  to 500°F  – 35 – 0.5 – 0.5 
  to 600°F  35 80 20 60 15 50 
 Residue from distillation, volume %  78 – 76 – 82 – 

Tests on distillation residue:        
 Polymer  SBR – – 
 Polymer content, % (solids basis) Tex-533-C 2.0 – – – – – 
 Penetration, 100 g, 5 sec., 77°F T 49 150 300 180 – 180 – 
 Ductility, 5 cm/min., 39.2°F, cm T 51 50 – – – – – 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 99.0 – 99.0 – 99.0 – 

2.4. Emulsified Asphalt. Provide emulsified asphalt that is homogeneous, does not separate after thorough 
mixing, and meets the requirements for the specified type and grade in Tables 7, 8, 9, and 10. 

 
Table 7 

Emulsified Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

Rapid-Setting Medium-Setting Slow-Setting 

HFRS-2 MS-2 AES-300 SS-1 SS-1H 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol T 72           
 77°F, sec.  – – – – 75 400 20 100 20 100 
 122°F, sec.  150 400 100 300 – – – – – – 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 

Miscibility T 59 – – – Pass Pass 

Cement mixing, % T 59 – – – – – – – 2.0 – 2.0 

Coating ability and water 
resistance: 

T 59           

 Dry aggregate/after spray  – – Good/Fair – – 
 Wet aggregate/after 

spray 
 – – Fair/Fair – – 

Demulsibility, 35 mL of 
0.02 N CaCl2, % 

T 59 50 – – 30 – – – – – – 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 

Freezing test, 3 cycles1 T 59 – Pass – Pass Pass 

Distillation test: T 59           
 Residue by distillation, % 

by wt. 
 65 – 65 – 65 – 60 – 60 – 

 Oil distillate, % by volume 
of emulsion 

 – 0.5 – 0.5 – 5 – 0.5 – 0.5 

Tests on residue from 
distillation: 

           

 Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 
5 sec. 

T 49 100 140 120 160 300 – 120 160 70 100 

 Solubility in 
trichloroethylene, % 

T 44 97.5 – 97.5  97.5 – 97.5 – 97.5 – 

 Ductility, 77°F, 
5 cm/min., cm 

T 51 100 – 100  – – 100 – 80 – 

 Float test, 140°F, sec. T 50 1,200 – –  1,200 – – – – – 

1. Applies only when the Engineer designates material for winter use. 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph533.pdf
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Table 8 
Cationic Emulsified Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

Rapid-Setting Medium-Setting Slow-Setting 

CRS-2 CRS-2H CMS-2 CMS-2S CSS-1 CSS-1H 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol 
T 72 

            
 77°F, sec. – – – – – – – – 20 100 20 100 
 122°F, sec. 150 400 150 400 100 300 100 300 – – – – 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 

Cement mixing, % T 59 – – – – – – – – – 2.0 – 2.0 

Coating ability and water resistance: 
T 59 

      
 Dry aggregate/after spray – – Good/Fair Good/Fair – – 
 Wet aggregate/after spray – – Fair/Fair Fair/Fair – – 

Demulsibility, 35 mL of 0.8% 
Sodium dioctyl sulfosuccinate, % 

T 59 70 – 70 – – – – – – – – – 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 

Particle charge T 59 Positive Positive Positive Positive Positive Positive 

Distillation test: 

T 59 

            
 Residue by distillation, % by wt. 65 – 65 – 65 – 65 – 60 – 60 – 
 Oil distillate, % by volume of 

emulsion 
– 0.5 – 0.5 – 7 – 5 – 0.5 – 0.5 

Tests on residue from distillation:              
 Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 120 160 70 110 120 200 300 – 120 160 70 110 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 97.5 – 97.5 – 97.5 – 97.5 – 97.5 – 97.5 – 
 Ductility, 77°F, 5 cm/min., cm T 51 100 – 80 – 100 – – – 100 – 80 – 

 
Table 9 

Polymer-Modified Emulsified Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

Rapid-Setting Medium-Setting Slow-Setting 

RS-1P HFRS-2P AES-150P AES-300P AES-300S SS-1P 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol T 72             
 77°F, sec.  – – – – 75 400 75 400 75 400 30 100 
 122°F, sec.  50 200 150 400 – – – – – – – – 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 

Miscibility T 59 – – – – – Pass 

Coating ability and water resistance: T 59       
 Dry aggregate/after spray  – – Good/Fair Good/Fair Good/Fair – 
 Wet aggregate/after spray  – – Fair/Fair Fair/Fair Fair/Fair – 

Demulsibility, 35 mL of 0.02 N CaCl2, % T 59 60 – 50 – – – – – – – – – 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 – 1 

Breaking index, g Tex-542-C – 80 – – – – – – – – – – 

Distillation test:1 T 59             
 Residue by distillation, % by wt.  65 – 65 – 65 – 65 – 65 – 60 – 
 Oil distillate, % by volume of 

emulsion 
 – 3 – 0.5 – 3 – 5 – 7 – 0.5 

Tests on residue from distillation:              
 Polymer content, wt. % (solids basis) Tex-533-C – – 3.0 – – – – – – – 3.0 – 
 Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 225 300 90 140 150 300 300 – 300 – 100 140 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 97.0 – 97.0 – 97.0 – 97.0 – 97.0 – 97.0 – 
 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 – – 1,500 – – – – – – – 1,300 – 
 Float test, 140°F, sec. T 50 – – 1,200 – 1,200 – 1,200 – 1,200 – – – 
 Ductility,2 39.2°F, 5 cm/min., cm T 51 – – 50 – – – – – – – 50 – 
 Elastic recovery,2 50°F, % Tex-539-C 55 – 55 – – – – – – – – – 

Tests on RTFO curing of distillation 
residue Tex-541-C             
 Elastic recovery, 50°F, % Tex-539-C – – – – 50 – 50 – 30 – – – 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph542.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph533.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph539.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph541.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph539.pdf
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Property Test 
Procedure 

Type–Grade 

1. Exception to T 59: Bring the temperature on the lower thermometer slowly to 350°F ±10°F. Maintain at this temperature for 20 min. 
Complete total distillation in 60 min. (±5 min.) from the first application of heat. 

2. HFRS-2P must meet one of either the ductility or elastic recovery requirements. 
Table 10 

Polymer-Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type-Grade 

Rapid-Setting Medium-Setting Slow-Setting 

CRS-1P CRS-2P CHFRS-2P CMS-1P3 CMS-2P3 CSS-1P 

Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol T 72             
 77°F, sec.  – – – – – – 20 100 – – 20 100 
 122°F, sec.  50 150 150 400 100 400 – – 50 400 – – 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 

Demulsibility, 35 mL of 0.8% Sodium 
dioctyl sulfosuccinate, % 

T 59 60 – 70 – 60 – – – – – – – 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 – 1 – 1 – – – – – 1 

Breaking index, g Tex-542-C – 80 – – – – – – – – – – 

Particle charge T 59 Positive Positive Positive Positive Positive Positive 

Distillation test:1 T 59             
 Residue by distillation, % by weight  65 – 65 – 65 – 65 – 65 – 62 – 
 Oil distillate, % by volume of emulsion  – 3 – 0.5 – 0.5 – 0.5 – 0.5 – 0.5 

Tests on residue from distillation:              
 Polymer content, wt. % (solids 

basis) 
Tex-533-C 

– – 3.0 – 3.0 – – – – – 3.0 – 

 Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 225 300 90 150 80 130 40 – 40 – 55 90 
 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 – – 1,300 – 1,300 – – 5,000 – 5,000 – – 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 97.0 – 97.0 – 95.0 – – – – – 97.0 – 
 Softening point, °F T 53 – – – – 130 – – – – – 135 – 
 Ductility, 77°F, 5 cm/min., cm T 51 – – – – – – – – – – 70 – 
 Float test, 140°F, sec. T 50 – – – – 1,800 – – – – –   
 Ductility,2 39.2°F, 5 cm/min., cm T 51 – – 50 – – – – – – – – – 
 Elastic recovery,2 50°F, % Tex-539-C 45 – 55 – 55 – 45 – 45 – – – 

Tests on rejuvenating agent:              
 Viscosity, 140°F, cSt T 201 – – – – – – 50 175 50 175 – – 
 Flash point, C.O.C., °F T 48 – – – – – – 380 – 380 – – – 
 Saturates, % by weight D2007 – – – – – – – 30 – 30 – – 
 Solubility in n-pentane, % by weight D2007 – – – – – – 99 – 99 – – – 

Tests on rejuvenating agent after TFO or 
RTFO: 

T 240 or 
T 179 

            

 Weight Change, %  – – – – – – – 6.5 – 6.5 – – 
 Viscosity Ratio  – – – – – – – 3.0 – 3.0 – – 

Tests on latex:4              
 Tensile strength, die C dumbbell, 

psi 
D4125 – – – – – – 500 – 500 – – – 

 Change in mass after immersion in 
rejuvenating agent, % 

D471 – – – – – – – 406 – 406 – – 

1. Exception to T 59: Bring the temperature on the lower thermometer slowly to 350°F (±0°F). Maintain at this temperature for 20 min. 
Complete total distillation in 60 min. (±5 min.) from the first application of heat. 

2. CRS-2P must meet one of either the ductility or elastic recovery requirements. 
3. With all precertification samples of CMS-1P or CMS-2P, submit certified test reports showing that the rejuvenating agent and latex 

meet the stated requirements. Submit samples of these raw materials if requested by the Engineer. 
4. Preparation of latex films: Use any substrate which produces a film of uniform cross-section. Apply latex using a drawdown tool that 

will deliver enough material to achieve desired residual thickness. Cure films for 14 days at 75°F and 50% relative humidity. 
5. Cut samples for tensile strength determination using a crosshead speed of 20 in./min. 
6. Specimen must remain intact after exposure and removal of excess rejuvenating agent. 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph542.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph533.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph539.pdf
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2.5. Specialty Emulsions. Provide specialty emulsion that is either asphalt-based or resin-based and meets the 
requirements of Table 11. 

Table 11 
Specialty Emulsions 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Type–Grade 

Medium-Setting Slow-Setting 

AE–P EAP&T PCE
1
 

Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol T 72       
 77°F, sec.  – – – – 10 100 
 122°F, sec.  15 150 – – – – 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 – 0.1 – 0.1 

Miscibility2 T 59 –  Pass  Pass  

Demulsibility, 35 mL of 0.10 N CaCl2, % T 59 – 70 – – – – 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 – 1 – – 

Particle size,5 % by volume < 2.5 m Tex-238-F3 – – 90 – 90 – 

Asphalt emulsion distillation to 500°F 
followed by Cutback asphalt distillation of 
residue to 680°F: 

T 59 & T 78       

 Residue after both distillations, % by wt.  40 – – – – – 
 Total oil distillate from both distillations, % 

by volume of emulsion 
 25 40 – – – – 

Residue by distillation, % by wt. T 59 – – 60 – – – 

Residue by evaporation,4 % by wt. T 59 – – – – 60 – 

Tests on residue after all distillation(s):        
 Viscosity, 140°F, poise T 202 – – 800 – – – 
 Kinematic viscosity,5 140°F, cSt T 201 – – – – 100 350 
 Flash point C.O.C., °F T 48 – – – – 400 – 
 Solubility in trichloroethylene, % T 44 97.5 – – – – – 
 Float test, 122°F, sec. T 50 50 200 – – – – 

1. Supply with each shipment of PCE: 
 a copy of a lab report from an approved analytical lab, signed by a lab official, indicating the PCE formulation 

does not meet any characteristics of a Resource Conservation Recovery Act (RCRA) hazardous waste; 

 a certification from the producer that the formulation supplied does not differ from the one tested and that no 

listed RCRA hazardous wastes or Polychlorinated Biphenyls (PCBs) have been mixed with the product; and 

 a Safety Data Sheet. 

2. Exception to T 59: In dilution, use 350 mL of distilled or deionized water and a 1,000-mL beaker. 
3. Use Tex-238-F, beginning at “Particle Size Analysis by Laser Diffraction,” with distilled or deionized water as a 

medium and no dispersant, or use another approved method. 
4. Exception to T 59: Leave sample in the oven until foaming ceases, then cool and weigh. 
5. PCE must meet either the kinematic viscosity requirement or the particle size requirement. 

2.6. Recycling Agent. Recycling agent and emulsified recycling agent must meet the requirements in Table 12. 
Additionally, recycling agent and residue from emulsified recycling agent, when added in the specified 
proportions to the recycled asphalt, must meet the properties specified on the plans. 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit238.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit238.pdf
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Table 12 
Recycling Agent and Emulsified Recycling Agent 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 
Recycling Agent 

Emulsified Recycling 
Agent 

Min Max Min Max 

Viscosity, Saybolt Furol, 77°F, sec. T 72 – – 15 100 

Sieve test, % T 59 – – – 0.1 

Miscibility1 T 59 – No coagulation 

Residue by evaporation,2 % by wt. T 59 – – 60 – 

Tests on recycling agent or residue from evaporation:      

Flash point, C.O.C., °F T 48 400 – 400 – 

Kinematic viscosity, T 201     

 140°F, cSt  75 200 75 200 

 275°F, cSt  – 10.0 – 10.0 

2. Exception to T 59: Use 0.02 N CaCl2 solution in place of water. 
3. Exception to T 59: Maintain sample at 300°F until foaming ceases, then cool and weigh. 

2.7. Crumb Rubber Modifier. Crumb rubber modifier (CRM) consists of automobile and truck tires processed by 
ambient temperature grinding. 

CRM must be: 

 free from contaminants including fabric, metal, and mineral and other nonrubber substances; 

 free-flowing; and 

 nonfoaming when added to hot asphalt binder. 

Ensure rubber gradation meets the requirements of the grades in Table 13 when tested in accordance with 
Tex-200-F, Part I, using a 50-g sample. 

Table 13 
CRM Gradations 

Sieve Size 
(% Passing) 

Grade A Grade B Grade C Grade D Grade E 

Min Max Min Max Min Max 

As shown on 
the plans 

As 
approved 

#8 100 – – – – – 

#10 95 100 100 – – – 

#16 – – 70 100 100 – 

#30 – – 25 60 90 100 

#40 – – – – 45 100 

#50 0 10 – – – – 

#200 – – 0 5 – – 

2.8. Crack Sealer. Provide polymer-modified asphalt-emulsion crack sealer meeting the requirements of 
Table 14. Provide rubber-asphalt crack sealer meeting the requirements of Table 15. 

Table 14 
Polymer-Modified Asphalt-Emulsion Crack Sealer 

Property Test Procedure Min Max 

Rotational viscosity, 77°F, cP D 2196, Method A 10,000 25,000 

Sieve test, % T 59 – 0.1 

Storage stability, 1 day, % T 59 – 1 

Evaporation Tex-543-C   
 Residue by evaporation, % by wt.  65 – 

Tests on residue from evaporation:    
 Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 35 75 

 Softening point, °F T 53 140 – 

 Ductility, 39.2°F, 5 cm/min., cm T 51 100 – 

 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/200-F_series/pdfs/bit200.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph543.pdf
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Table 15 
Rubber-Asphalt Crack Sealer 

Property Test Procedure 
Class A Class B 

Min Max Min Max 

CRM content, Grade A or B, % by wt. Tex-544-C 22 26 – – 

CRM content, Grade B, % by wt. Tex-544-C – – 13 17 

Virgin rubber content,1 % by wt.  – – 2 – 

Flash point,2 C.O.C., °F T 48 400 – 400 – 

Penetration,3 77°F, 150 g, 5 sec. T 49 30 50 30 50 

Penetration,3 32°F, 200 g, 60 sec. T 49 12 – 12 – 

Softening point, °F T 53 – – 170 – 

Bond Test, non-immersed, 0.5 in specimen, 50% 
extension, 20°F4 D5329 – Pass 

1. Provide certification that the Min % virgin rubber was added. 
2. Agitate the sealing compound with a 3/8- to 1/2-in. (9.5- to 12.7-mm) wide, square-end metal spatula to bring 

the material on the bottom of the cup to the surface (i.e., turn the material over) before passing the test flame 
over the cup. Start at one side of the thermometer, move around to the other, and then return to the starting 
point using 8 to 10 rapid circular strokes. Accomplish agitation in 3 to 4 sec. Pass the test flame over the cup 
immediately after stirring is completed. 

3. Exception to T 49: Substitute the cone specified in D 217 for the penetration needle. 
4. Allow no crack in the crack sealing materials or break in the bond between the sealer and the mortar blocks 

over 1/4 in. deep for any specimen after completion of the test. 

2.9. Asphalt-Rubber Binders. Provide asphalt-rubber (A-R) binders that are mixtures of asphalt binder and 
CRM, which have been reacted at elevated temperatures. Provide A-R binders meeting D6114 and 
containing a minimum of 15% CRM by weight. Provide Types I or II, containing CRM Grade C, for use in hot-
mixed aggregate mixtures. Provide Types II or III, containing CRM Grade B, for use in surface treatment 
binder. Ensure binder properties meet the requirements of Table 16. 

Table 16 
A-R Binders 

Property 
Test 

Procedure 

Binder Type 

Type I Type II Type III 

Min Max Min Max Min Max 

Apparent viscosity, 347°F, cP 
D2196, 

Method A 
1,500 5,000 1,500 5,000 1,500 5,000 

Penetration, 77°F, 100 g, 5 sec. T 49 25 75 25 75 50 100 

Penetration, 39.2°F, 200 g, 60 sec. T 49 10 – 15 – 25 – 

Softening point, °F T 53 135 – 130 – 125 – 

Resilience, 77°F, % D5329 25 – 20 – 10 – 

Flash point, C.O.C., °F T 48 450 – 450 – 450 – 

Tests on residue from Thin-Film Oven 
Test: 

T 179       

 
Retained penetration ratio, 39.2°F, 
200 g, 60 sec., % of original 

T 49 75 – 75 – 75 – 

2.10. Performance-Graded Binders. Provide PG binders that are smooth and homogeneous, show no separation 
when tested in accordance with Tex-540-C, and meet the requirements of Table 17. 

Separation testing is not required if: 

 a modifier is introduced separately at the mix plant either by injection in the asphalt line or mixer, 

 the binder is blended on site in continuously agitated tanks, or 

 binder acceptance is based on field samples taken from an in-line sampling port at the hot-mix plant 

after the addition of modifiers. 

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph544.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph544.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph540.pdf
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Table 17 
Performance-Graded Binders 

Property and Test Method 

Performance Grade 

PG 58 PG 64 PG 70 PG 76 PG 82 

-22 -28 -34 -16 -22 -28 -34 -16 -22 -28 -34 -16 -22 -28 -34 -16 -22 -28 

Average 7-day max pavement design 
temperature, °C1 

< 58 < 64 < 70 < 76 < 82 

Min pavement design temperature, °C1 >-22 >-28 >-34 >-16 >-22 >-28 >-34 >-16 >-22 >-28 >-34 >-16 >-22 >-28 >-34 >-16 >-22 >-28 

Original Binder 

Flash point, T 48, Min, °C 230 

Viscosity, T 316:2,3  
 Max, 3.0 Pas, test temperature, °C 135 

Dynamic shear, T 315:4 

58 64 70 76 82 
 G*/sin(), Min, 1.00 kPa, Max, 2.00 

kPa,7 
Test temperature @ 10 rad/sec., °C 

Elastic recovery, D 6084, 50°F, % Min – – 30 – – 30 50 – 30 50 60 30 50 60 70 50 60 70 

Rolling Thin-Film Oven (Tex-541-C) 

Mass loss, Tex-541-C, Max, % 1.0 

Dynamic shear, T 315: 

58 64 70 76 82 
 G*/sin(, Min, 2.20 kPa, Max, 5.00 

kPa,7 
Test temperature @ 10 rad/sec., °C 

Pressure Aging Vessel (PAV) Residue (R 28) 

PAV aging temperature, °C 100 

Dynamic shear, T 315: 

25 22 19 28 25 22 19 28 25 22 19 28 25 22 19 28 25 22 G*sin(, Max, 5,000 kPa 
Test temperature @ 10 rad/sec., °C 

Creep stiffness, T 313:5,6 

-12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 
 S, max, 300 MPa, 

m-value, Min, 0.300 
Test temperature @ 60 sec., °C 

Direct tension, T 314:6 
-12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18 -24 -6 -12 -18  Failure strain, Min, 1.0% 

Test temperature @ 1.0 mm/min., °C 

1. Pavement temperatures are estimated from air temperatures using an algorithm contained in a Department-supplied computer program, 
may be provided by the Department, or by following the procedures outlined in AASHTO MP 2 and PP 28. 

2. This requirement may be waived at the Department’s discretion if the supplier warrants that the asphalt binder can be adequately 
pumped, mixed, and compacted at temperatures that meet all applicable safety, environmental, and constructability requirements. At test 
temperatures where the binder is a Newtonian fluid, any suitable standard means of viscosity measurement may be used, including 
capillary (T 201 or T 202) or rotational viscometry (T 316). 

3. Viscosity at 135°C is an indicator of mixing and compaction temperatures that can be expected in the lab and field. High values may 
indicate high mixing and compaction temperatures. Additionally, significant variation can occur from batch to batch. Contractors should 
be aware that variation could significantly impact their mixing and compaction operations. Contractors are therefore responsible for 
addressing any constructability issues that may arise. 

4. For quality control of unmodified asphalt binder production, measurement of the viscosity of the original asphalt binder may be 

substituted for dynamic shear measurements of G*/sin() at test temperatures where the asphalt is a Newtonian fluid. Any suitable 
standard means of viscosity measurement may be used, including capillary (T 201 or T 202) or rotational viscometry (T 316). 

5. Silicone beam molds, as described in AASHTO TP 1-93, are acceptable for use. 
6. If creep stiffness is below 300 MPa, direct tension test is not required. If creep stiffness is between 300 and 600 MPa, the direct tension 

failure strain requirement can be used instead of the creep stiffness requirement. The m-value requirement must be satisfied in both 
cases. 

7. Maximum values for unaged and RTFO aged dynamic shear apply only to materials used as substitute binders, as described in 
specification Items 340, “Dense-Graded Hot-Mix Asphalt (Small Quantity),” 341, “Dense-Graded Hot-Mix Asphalt,” and 344, “Superpave 
Mixtures.”  

http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph541.pdf
http://ftp.dot.state.tx.us/pub/txdot-info/cst/TMS/500-C_series/pdfs/aph541.pdf
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3. EQUIPMENT 

Provide all equipment necessary to transport, store, sample, heat, apply, and incorporate asphalts, oils, and 
emulsions. 

4. CONSTRUCTION 

Typical Material Use. Use materials shown in Table 18, unless otherwise determined by the Engineer. 

Table 18 
Typical Material Use 

Material Application Typically Used Materials 

Hot-mixed, hot-laid asphalt mixtures PG binders, A-R binders Types I and II 

Surface treatment 
AC-5, AC-10, AC-5 w/2% SBR, AC-10 w/2% SBR, AC-15P, AC-20XP, AC-
10-2TR, AC-20-5TR, HFRS-2, MS-2, CRS-2, CRS-2H, HFRS-2P,CRS-2P, 
CHFRS-2P, A-R binders Types II and III 

Surface treatment (cool weather) 
RS-1P, CRS-1P, RC-250, RC-800, RC-3000, MC-250, MC-800, MC-3000, 
MC-2400L 

Precoating AC-5, AC-10, PG 64-22, SS-1, SS-1H, CSS-1, CSS-1H 

Tack coat PG Binders, SS-1H, CSS-1H, EAP&T 

Fog seal SS-1, SS-1H, CSS-1, CSS-1H 

Hot-mixed, cold-laid asphalt mixtures AC-0.6, AC-1.5, AC-3, AES-300, AES-300P, CMS-2, CMS-2S 

Patching mix MC-800, SCM I, SCM II, AES-300S 

Recycling 
AC-0.6, AC-1.5, AC-3, AES-150P, AES-300P, recycling agent, emulsified 
recycling agent 

Crack sealing 
SS-1P, polymer mod AE crack sealant, rubber asphalt crack sealers 
(Class A, Class B) 

Microsurfacing CSS-1P 

Prime MC-30, AE-P, EAP&T, PCE 

Curing membrane SS-1, SS-1H, CSS-1, CSS-1H, PCE 

Erosion control SS-1, SS-1H, CSS-1, CSS-1H, PCE 

4.1. Storage and Application Temperatures. Use storage and application temperatures in accordance with 
Table 19. Store and apply materials at the lowest temperature yielding satisfactory results. Follow the 
manufacturer’s instructions for any agitation requirements in storage. Manufacturer’s instructions regarding 
recommended application and storage temperatures supersede those of Table 19. 
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Table 19 
Storage and Application Temperatures 

Type–Grade 

Application Storage 
Maximum 

(°F) 
Recommended Range 

(°F) 
Maximum Allowable 

(°F) 

AC-0.6, AC-1.5, AC-3 200–300 350 350 

AC-5, AC-10 275–350 350 350 

AC-5 w/2% SBR, AC-10 w/2% SBR, AC-15P, AC-20-5TR 300–375 375 360 

RC-250 125–180 200 200 

RC-800 170–230 260 260 

RC-3000 215–275 285 285 

MC-30, AE-P 70–150 175 175 

MC-250 125–210 240 240 

MC-800, SCM I, SCM II 175–260 275 275 

MC-3000, MC-2400L 225–275 290 290 

HFRS-2, MS-2, CRS-2, CRS-2H, HFRS-2P, CRS-2P, 
CMS-2, CMS-2S, AES-300, AES-300S, AES-150P, 
AES-300P 

120–160 180 180 

SS-1, SS-1H, CSS-1, CSS-1H, PCE, EAP&T, SS-1P, 
RS-1P, CRS-1P, CSS-1P, recycling agent, emulsified 
recycling agent, polymer mod AE crack sealant 

50–130 140 140 

PG binders 275–350 350 350 

Rubber asphalt crack sealers (Class A, Class B) 350–375 400 – 

A-R binders Types I, II, and III 325–425 425 425 

5. MEASUREMENT AND PAYMENT 

The work performed, materials furnished, equipment, labor, tools, and incidentals will not be measured or 
paid for directly but is subsidiary or is included in payment for other pertinent Items. 



DISCLOSURE OF CERTAIN RELATIONSHIPS 

Effective January 1, 2006, Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code requires 
that any vendor or person considering doing business with a local government entity 
disclose in the Questionnaire Form CIQ, the vendor or person's affiliation or business 
relationship that might cause a conflict of interest with a local government entity. By law, 
this questionnaire must be filed with the County Clerk of Howard County no later than 
the 7th business day after the date the person becomes aware of facts that require the 
statement to be filed. See Section 176.006, Local Government Code. A person commits 
an offense if the person violates Section 176.006, Local Government Code. An offense 
under this section is a Class C misdemeanor.  

A copy of the law is available at 
http://www.statutes.legis.state.tx.us/Docs/LG/htm/LG.176.htm 
 
Frequently ask questions are available at:https://www.county.org/member-services/legal-
resources/publications/Documents/Disclosure%20of%20Certain%20Business%20Relatio
nships.pdf 

The forms for reporting are available at: https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/forms/CIQ.pdf 

By submitting a response to this request, the vendor represents that it is in compliance 
with the requirements of Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code. 

Please turn completed forms to the Howard County Auditor's Office located at 300 Main, 
Room 202 Big Spring, TX or mail to P.O. Box 1949, Big Spring, TX 79721. 
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	1. Bids are to be submitted on this form.  Be sure to include both pages 1 & 2. Each bid shall be placed in an envelope, sealed and properly identified with the bid title and delivered to the County Auditor’s Office before 10:00 A.M., Friday August 24...
	2. The County is exempt from Federal Excise Tax, State Tax and Local Tax. Do not include tax in bid. If it is determined that tax was included in the bid, it will not be included in the tabulation or any awards and will be deleted from subsequent invo...
	3. Bids cannot be altered or amended after opening time. Any alterations made before opening time must be signed by the bidder or his agent. No bid can be withdrawn after the opening time without approval of the Commissioners’ Court based on reasonabl...
	4. The County will evaluate the bids and make awards for supplies, materials, services and equipment on the basis of the lowest and best bid, which meet the specifications.
	5. The County reserves the right to accept or reject all or any part of any bid and award the bid to best serve the interest of the County.
	6. By signing and executing this bid, the bidder certifies and represents to the County that bidder has not offered, conferred or agreed to confer any pecuniary benefit or other thing of value for the receipt of special treatment, advantage, informati...
	7. Bidder further certifies and represents that bidder has not violated any State, Federal, Local Law regulations or ordinance relating to bribery, improper influence, collusion, discrimination or other similar crimes and all items or services provide...
	8. Awarded bid will be paid for out of current county funds.
	9. Bid unit price on quantity specified, extend and show total. In case of errors in extension, unit price shall govern.
	10. Unless otherwise noted, bid prices must be firm for acceptance 60 days from opening date of bid and remain firm until September 30, 2017.
	11. Must meet Howard County Standard Specification for Item 302M Aggregates for Surface Treatments.
	12. Bid must show the number of days required to produce material under normal conditions after receipt of an order.
	13. Material will be delivered to Knott, Texas in Howard County.  The quantities in the proposal are approximate. The quantities of work and materials may be increased or decreased as considered necessary to complete the work as planned and contemplat...
	Please initial _________                                                               NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 1
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	Notice to Bidders(ASPH)
	1. Bids are to be submitted on this form.  Be sure to include both pages 1 & 2. Each bid shall be placed in an envelope, sealed and properly identified with the bid title and delivered to the County Auditor’s Office before 10:00 A.M., Friday August 24...
	2. The County is exempt from Federal Excise Tax, State Tax and Local Tax. Do not include tax in bid. If it is determined that tax was included in the bid, it will not be included in the tabulation or any awards and will be deleted from subsequent invo...
	3. Bids cannot be altered or amended after opening time. Any alterations made before opening time must be signed by the bidder or his agent. No bid can be withdrawn after the opening time without approval of the Commissioners’ Court based on reasonabl...
	4. The County will evaluate the bids and make awards for supplies, materials, services and equipment on the basis of the lowest and best bid, which meet the specifications.
	5. The County reserves the right to accept or reject all or any part of any bid and award the bid to best serve the interest of the County.
	6. By signing and executing this bid, the bidder certifies and represents to the County that bidder has not offered, conferred or agreed to confer any pecuniary benefit or other thing of value for the receipt of special treatment, advantage, informati...
	7. Bidder further certifies and represents that bidder has not violated any State, Federal, Local Law regulations or ordinance relating to bribery, improper influence, collusion, discrimination or other similar crimes and all items or services provide...
	8. Awarded bid will be paid for out of current county funds.
	9. Bid unit price on quantity specified, extend and show total. In case of errors in extension, unit price shall govern.
	10. Unless otherwise noted, bid prices must be firm for acceptance 60 days from opening date of bid and remain firm until September 30, 2017.
	11. Must meet TxDOT 2014 Standard Specification for Item 300 Asphalts, Oils, and Emulsions RC-250.
	12. Bid must show the number of days required to produce material under normal conditions after receipt of an order.
	13. Material will be delivered to Knott, Texas in Howard County.  The quantities in the proposal are approximate. The quantities of work and materials may be increased or decreased as considered necessary to complete the work as planned and contemplat...
	Please initial _________                                                               NOTICE TO BIDDER PAGE 1
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